
Description Qty Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost

30 Yd Rectangle Roll Off Container 23 4,967.00$                 EA 114,241.00$                           4,950.00$                EA 113,850.00$                           5,150.00$                 EA 118,450.00$                           

20 Yd Rectangle Roll Off Container 4 4,335.00$                 EA 17,340.00$                              4,350.00$                EA 17,400.00$                              4,760.00$                 EA 19,040.00$                              

40 Yd Rectangle Roll Off Container 1 6,692.00$                 EA 6,692.00$                                5,525.00$                EA 5,525.00$                                6,024.00$                 EA 6,024.00$                                

42 Yd Rectangle Roll Off Receiver Container 3 8,513.00$                 EA 25,539.00$                              10,975.00$              EA 32,925.00$                              7,515.00$                 EA 22,545.00$                              

2 Dr., 25 Yd Recycling Containers 4 6,792.00$                 EA 27,168.00$                              7,375.00$                EA 29,500.00$                              6,870.00$                 EA 27,480.00$                              

2 Yd "SealPack" Stationary Compactors 

w/Doghouse 2 NO BID EA NO BID NO BID EA NO BID 23,695.00$               EA 47,390.00$                              

190,980.00$                           199,200.00$                           240,929.00$                           

Included in above prices Unit prices include freight 5,918.00$                                

13,368.60$                              13,944.00$                              17,279.29$                              

204,348.60$                           213,144.00$                           264,126.29$                           

1 Yr, see details attached

 Standard 1 Yr., see details 

attached 1 yr/3 yrs.

NA NA N/A

30-45 Working Days 45-60 Business Days ARO [Blank]

 Yes, see Exceptions Page & 

Checklists 

 Yes, see Exceptions Page & 

Checklists [Blank] See checklists.

 Non-resident Bidder; 

Lewisburg, PA 

 Non-resident Bidder;  

Charlotte, NC 

 Non-resident Bidder; Lenoir, 

NC 

 Vendor does not collect 

sales tax, but added 7% sales 

tax to bid cost that County 

will have to pay to the state.  NA 

 An additional 1.5% discount 

will be applied if all items are 

awarded (no split award). 

Description Qty Total Cost

30 Yd Rectangle Roll Off Container 23 4,753.00$                 EA 109,319.00$                           

20 Yd Rectangle Roll Off Container 4 4,255.00$                 EA 17,020.00$                              

40 Yd Rectangle Roll Off Container 1 5,830.00$                 EA 5,830.00$                                

42 Yd Rectangle Roll Off Receiver Container 3 7,389.00$                 EA 22,167.00$                              

2 Dr., 25 Yd Recycling Containers 4 7,486.00$                 EA 29,944.00$                              

2 Yd "SealPack" Stationary Compactors 

w/Doghouse 2 13,982.00$               EA 27,964.00$                              

212,244.00$                           

10,200.00$                              

15,571.08$                              

238,015.08$                           

[Blank]-No

[Blank]-No

[Blank]

 Yes, see Exceptions Page & 

Checklists 

 Simpsonville, SC 

 NA 

Exceptions?

Additional Notes

Residence

Included Warranty

Delivery Date/# of days 

for delivery

Extended Warranty

SC Sales Tax (7%):

TOTAL BID COST:

Sub-Total:

Shipping/Freight:

Rudco South, LLC

Price/Unit

Delivery Date/# of days 

for delivery

Exceptions?

Additional Notes

Bakers Waste Equipment

Price/Unit

Sub-Total:

Shipping/Freight:

SC Sales Tax (7%):

TOTAL BID COST:

Extended Warranty

Residence

Additional Notes

Price/Unit

Sub-Total:

Shipping/Freight:

SC Sales Tax (7%):

TOTAL BID COST:

Included Warranty

Delivery Date/# of days 

for delivery

Exceptions?

Additional Notes

Exceptions?

Extended  Warranty Extended Warranty

ResidenceResidence

Delivery Date/# of days 

for delivery

Price/Unit

Sub-Total:

Custom Container Solutions

Shipping/Freight:

Bid Worksheet for Bid# 17-083, FY18 Containers & Compactors for Recycling

Wastequip

SC Sales Tax (7%):

TOTAL BID COST:

Included  Warranty Included Warranty
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