
BASE BID:            Facility Cost-(Per Day) Cost-(Per Month) Cost-(Per Day)* Cost-(Per Month)* Cost-(Per Day) Cost-(Per Month) Cost-(Per Day) Cost-(Per Month)

Department of Social Services $120.00 $2,600.00 $48.00 $960.00 $77.77 $1,685.00 $71.21 $1,542.96

Georgetown County Health Department $75.00 $1,625.00 [Blank] $900.00 $49.94 $1,082.07 $58.45 $1,266.44

Choppee Medical Complex *A-Z Janitorial Costs based on avg. of 20 days

a)      Suite 1-Common Areas $75.00 $1,625.00 [Blank] [Blank] $30.38 $658.33 $25.00 $433.35

b)      Suite 2-St. James-Santee $75.00 $1,625.00 [Blank] [Blank] $33.46 $725.00 $46.43 $804.77

Subtotal for Choppee Medical Complex $150.00 $3,250.00 [Blank] $900.00 $63.84 $1,383.33 $71.43 $1,238.12

Total for All 3 Facilities $345.00 $7,475.00 [Blank] $2,760.00 $191.55 $4,150.40 $201.09 $4,047.52
Hourly Rate for Emergency/Unplanned Circumstances 

(Per Person/Per Hour)

ADD/ALTERNATE #1:      Facility
Carpet Cleaning 

(Per Occurance)

 Floor Stripping     

& Waxing            

(Per Occurrence)

Carpet Cleaning 

(Per Occurance)

 Floor Stripping     

& Waxing            

(Per Occurrence)

Carpet Cleaning 

(Per Occurance)

 Floor Stripping     

& Waxing            

(Per Occurrence)

Carpet Cleaning 

(Per Occurance)

 Floor Stripping     

& Waxing            

(Per Occurrence)

Department of Social Services $715.50 $364.50 $300.00 $300.00 $2,862.00 $1,458.00 $1,717.20 $1,530.90

Georgetown County Health Department $180.00 $500.00 $300.00 $300.00 $940.00 $1,780.00 $564.00 $1,869.00

Choppee Medical Complex

a)      Suite 1-Common Areas $150.00 $150.00 [Blank] [Blank] $511.00 $484.40 $150.00 $590.35

b)      Suite 2-St. James-Santee $150.00 $150.00 [Blank] [Blank] $566.40 $446.40 $150.00 $1,096.37

Subtotal for Choppee Medical Complex $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $1,077.40 $930.80 $300.00 $1,686.72

Total for All 3 Facilities $1,195.50 $1,164.50 $900.00 $900.00 $4,879.40 $4,168.80 $2,581.20 $5,086.62

Number of Days to begin after Notice of Award

Exceptions:

Resident Bidder for Local Preference:

Attended Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting?

Davis Services dba Southern 

Hospitality
A-Z Janitorial Services, Inc.

$17.00

None None

CMA Services, Inc. Jani-King of Myrtle Beach

$10.00 per person x 2 people = $20.00 

hrly
$12.70 $25.00

None See Bid Exceptions Page

7 Days ASAP/ 0 Days 30 Days 14 Days

Yes, Andrews, SC Yes, Andrews, SC No, Hartsville, SC No, Myrtle Beach, SC

Yes Yes Yes Yes
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BASE BID:            Facility Cost-(Per Day) Cost-(Per Month) Cost-(Per Day) Cost-(Per Month) Cost-(Per Day) Cost-(Per Month) Cost-(Per Day) Cost-(Per Month)

Department of Social Services $150.00 $3,000.00 $105.00 $2,275.00 $139.06 $3,476.50 $47.00 $1,010.50

Georgetown County Health Department $110.00 $2,200.00 $100.00 $2,167.00 [No Bid] [No Bid] $48.00 $1,032.00

Choppee Medical Complex

a)      Suite 1-Common Areas $87.49 $1,399.84 $25.00 $434.00 [No Bid] [No Bid] $28.00 $481.60

b)      Suite 2-St. James-Santee $102.77 $1,644.32 $50.00 $867.00 [No Bid] [No Bid] $28.00 $481.60

Subtotal for Choppee Medical Complex $190.26 $3,044.16 $75.00 $1,301.00 [No Bid] [No Bid] $56.00 $963.20

Total for All 3 Facilities $450.26 $8,244.16 $280.00 $5,743.00 [No Bid] [No Bid] $151.00 $3,005.70
Hourly Rate for Emergency/Unplanned Circumstances 

(Per Person/Per Hour)

ADD/ALTERNATE #1:      Facility
Carpet Cleaning 

(Per Occurance)

 Floor Stripping     

& Waxing            

(Per Occurrence)

Carpet Cleaning 

(Per Occurance)

 Floor Stripping     

& Waxing            

(Per Occurrence)

Carpet Cleaning 

(Per Occurance)

 Floor Stripping     

& Waxing            

(Per Occurrence)

Carpet Cleaning 

(Per Occurance)

 Floor Stripping     

& Waxing            

(Per Occurrence)

Department of Social Services $650.00 $925.00 Included Included [No Bid] [No Bid] $858.60 $2,041.20

Georgetown County Health Department $350.00 $1,125.00 " " [No Bid] [No Bid] $376.00 $2,492.00

Choppee Medical Complex

a)      Suite 1-Common Areas $150.00 $525.00 " " [No Bid] [No Bid] $150.00 $2,099.00

b)      Suite 2-St. James-Santee $0.00 $726.99 " " [No Bid] [No Bid] $75.00 $1,575.00

Subtotal for Choppee Medical Complex $150.00 $1,251.99 " " [No Bid] [No Bid] $225.00 $3,674.00

Total for All 3 Facilities $1,150.00 $3,301.99 Included Included [No Bid] [No Bid] $1,459.60 $8,207.20

Number of Days to begin after Notice of Award

Exceptions:

Georgetown County Board of 

DSN

Matt's Professional Cleaning 

Service, LLC

$13.50/$27.00 $15.00 to $20.00 Hr. [Blank] $13.50/$65.00

C & D Landscaping & Janitorial 

Services
Muscle Clean II

[Blank] None

5 Days 5 Days Within 5 days

None

7 to 14 Days

None
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